- 109

by

oot e |
FHER H1-1
(prdfardl 1 witra afera)
HeTeraR, 29 s, 2003/31mau1 07,1925(21)

AT reze, 3t TS ©osT dierdi= gy |

1. 2.00 fy9w Seara(f%-280) : WW#WEBO%WWWﬂ

g

0.

4
2

3

4

5.

5
7

8

9.

1

1

1

1

1
.o
3.

st < v (ered) famra =t 7 exaay fdar )
2t 7 freiR i

oAt ‘areg &g dreH

s e e

&} T G

St S I AT

2 qig s i

s 4R e

ofY iy o

2 9} T

. 8l R AR

aﬂ MUE sHale
<l sN|d) fexor anferan

R quaq?umaﬁmm}mm

|

sft aroa T, uRags 3 A A} aEel & o) e @re USiieYu GH

T % v § uren FEE & wde § 17 91,2003 3 o SRR A uR 6eE
gyed oY I |

3. 2.56 Ul BT IR BRI :

™y,

A

st e v Tt 2 Pr=afeRaa uvara fean f6:-

Tg Ao [7id 28 Jors, 2003 & ¥e # ywa fw afif & dRR
giddes & Wehd ®

Y19 &1 Hae & ford v A W Wi fear man |

A goe vt FafaRaa uwam fsan -

g e 7% 28 ens, 2003 B Hed § wRgy 9 W BRI B I
9 andea ¥ W geal W RER o 'y fed w@ed @ affa & g
yRtries 9 wewa 2 |

TR B e & ol 31 i oiR wieR et |



ey
‘J

4. 3.02 fw W AR g uiRe &=

EE

4.10

4.45

£

ot erew g, Riwra 1 3 gwg few B Rieeh FedN SRR Rigka®,2008(2003
e den-9) w far e e |

efafaa v 3 o=t § 9m o -

AR LI

st vy T

Sl St et

. Y e feaR i

st e <M, g w5l 3 =t & o R |

St P A pa =

g ST A & fod wIfig gan |
g+ gr: I gan |

feeehl wrmdt afafai Rdye,2003 &) wvsar o=t & R fmy 1 -

Fretferan witerl @l wega fear mn ok 97 o1 fofa R e -

T 80 et gl | FrafoRea deies wea @b @ ar1-3(1 ) F @ afag
USTia® ENT % ¥ W ) |fR doflas (wemei ) iR dofkae (<=nfe) B
gl 9 |
WG B 7O $ o v v ofR et frar |

2. mmammﬁﬁmﬁmeﬁwrw-ﬁ(2)(1;{)ﬁ3ﬁat-ﬂ=wd
& W X giE gy far o) |
ALY D) W @Y Ay @ g A forar Ty |

- SLOTTRIT Tl | FrfeRea denem wega e aR-11(2) (@) § weg @t o
& @ )X e gy fher o) |
HEE B 7AG™ & R w1 77 R AR R Ty |

4. aﬂsﬁvamm%ﬁmﬁfﬁaawﬁwwﬁm:-w-%(&ﬁwﬁqaé

@ W9 W giE 9y vy o) |

e B weT Y Eia | g o for |

ﬁ%%ﬁ%ﬁﬂ%ﬁaﬁmﬁmmﬁm:(wmaﬁjﬁﬁﬁ)

e B AIGH $ o’ ¥ T iR e R fhar a1 |

6. <. s gt 3 wWre-40, wWrs-40(4), Wre-86 vd wus- 101(1)(d) 3
fPrefeien wenem uega f-

(T et Heler 3ot § 3w)

w

¢}



Rl

R w4 3 yearg RN B Rdge o oRke frm s |
WA B Hae™ B ford v W 3w wowsfa @ wier fear |

5. 5.20 FrRM-89 & s=rid d&ed ¢
Loy W@ w1 g1 28 Sers, 2003 # Wew § qega i geer o o gl |

"ag R 9w Rech @) w5w @ geil @7 & Hey # 39 wed g 11 Rwrar, 2002 $
ifE gEaE $ EAREfd el ©

uE e facell @ 9=a1 &1 U &1 gl o4 # fRy o @ faam w el = e vl
g1

TORA P 3R AP qRA-qeR T T @l @) AHRAR 3iE SR F BRol e
# gl v e i W @ 99 & Seewg 9 fieeh @B AW &1 T UG #XA drel
g @ e e wu e o |

Frafafaa wew) A =9t 4 9 foar -
3t 3xfagv g dat

Bl el J

1. st fwor arferan

3ft =g fpeix i

51 forel f&g e

20 TTeY g 9rm

3N wfg=x e IRars

A1 9 gHare

R 93t A =l &1 SR fean |

Hered 1 YaaE & R 3@ a1 R wduHfd 9 WieR fhar i |

7.08 wea ffEET F1d a% & ford wiffa g |
g NI IE - ST

@ N O oA~ 0N~

Rt frgref ¥
)9 Selrs, 2003 wfug



DELHI LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
Bulletin Part — I
(Brief summary of proceedings)
Tuesday 29" July 2003/7 Shravan 1925 (Saka)

No.l%

1 2.00 (Shri Subhash Chopra, Hon'ble Speaker in-chair)
PM Speclal Mention (Rule 280): The following Members raised matters under Rule 280:
" © ‘Y. - Shri Ram Bhaj (The Minister of Urban Development intervened)
2. Shri Nand Kishore Garg
3. Shri Sahab' Singh Chauhan
4. Shri Naseeb Singh
5. Shri Radhey Shyam Khanna
6. Shri Jai Bhagwan Aggarwal
7. Shri Mohan Singh Bisht
8. Shri Veer Singh
9. Shri Bheeshm Sharma
10. Shri Shadi Ram
11. Shr Surender Kumar
12. Shri Shoaib Igbal
13. Dr. (Smt.) Kiran Walia

2 255 Papers laid on the Table of the House:
Shri Ajay Maken, Minister of Transport laid copies of the Notification dated 17" Juns 2003
regarding Draft Rules on the introduction of Smart Card Registration Certificates for motor vehicles.

3 256  Adoption of Reports of House Committees:
1. Shri Malaram Gangwal moved the following MOthll “That this House agrees to the Third Report
of the Rules Committee presented to the House on 28" July 2003.”
The Motion was put to vote and adopted. -

2. Shri Mukesh Sharma moved the following Motion: “That this House agrees to the Second Report
of the House Committee on 20 Point Programme presented to the House on 28" July 2003.”
The Motion was put to vote and adopted.

4 3.02 Consideration and Passing of Bill:
The Minister of Development, Shri Haroon Yusuf, moved that “The Delhi Co-operative Societies
Bill, 2003” be taken into consider.
The following members participated in the debate:
1. Shri Shoaib Igbal
2. Shri Roop Chand
3. Dr. Jagdish Mukhi
4. Shri Naseeb Singh
5. Shri Nand Kishore Garg
Smt. Sheila Dikshit, Chief Minister replied to the debate.

4.10  The House adjourned for tea break.
PM
445  The House reassembled.
PM
“The Delhi Co-operative Societies Bill, 2003” was considered clause-wise.
The following amendments were moved and decided:
1. Dr. Jagdish Mukhi moved the following amendment: Clause 3(1): Delete the word “a person
to be the Registrar’ and substitute with the words ‘two persons to be the Registrar
(Administration) and Registrar (Judicial)’.
The amendment was put to vote and negated.
2. Shri Shoaib Igbal moved the following amendment: Clause 11 (2) (u): For the words ‘three
years’ substitute the words ‘five years.’
The amendment was withdrawn with the leave of the House.



3. Dr. Jagdish Mukhi moved the followmg amendment: Clause 11 (2) (u): For the words ‘three

years’ substitute the words ‘two years.’

The amendment was put to vote and negated.

4. Shri Shoaib Igbal moved the followmg amendment: Clause 35(3): For the words ‘three years

substitute the words ‘five years.’

The amendment was withdrawn with the leave of the House.

5. Shri Nand Kishore Garg moved the following amendment: Clause 35(3): aﬁcr the words

‘three years’ add the words ‘for co-operative societies having membership up to one thousand

and for five years for co-operanve societies having membership of more than one thousand’

The amendment was put to vote and negated.

6. The following amendments of Dr. Jagdish Mukhi were put to vote and negated:

a) Clause 40: Substitute the second proviso with the following: ‘provided further that no
member shall be expelled in the cases of sub-clause (i) and (ii) unless the resolution is
passezd by a majority of not less than three-fourths of the members present and entitled to
vote in the mecting of the committec and in the case of sub-clause (ii) unless the resolution
is passed by a majority of not less than three-fourth of the members present and entitled to
vote in the meeting of the General Body and no resolution for expulsion shall be valid unless
approved by the Registrar.’ .

b) Clause 40(4): Insert the words “service of before the words ‘such order’.

¢) Clause 86: Substitute the second proviso with the following: ‘provided further that mo
members shall be expelled in the cases of sub-clause (a) and (b) unless the resolution is
passzd by majority of not less than three-fourths of the members present and entitled to vote
in the meeting of the Committee and in the case of the sub-clause (c) unless the resolution is
passzd by a majority of not less than three fourths of the members present and enttled to
vote in the meeting of the General Body and no resolution for expulsion shall be valid unless
approved by the registrar.’

d) Clause 101 (1)(d): After sub-clause (d) the following proviso be inserted: ‘provided that no
property of Co-operative Society having market value exceeding Rs. 1000/- shall be
disposed of through private sale by the liquidator.’

The Minister of Development moved that the Bill be passed.
The Motion was put to vote and adopted unanimously.

5 520 Resolution (Under Rule 89):
PM Debate on the Resolution moved by the Hon’ble Chief Minister on 28™ July 2003 continued. The
following members participated in the debate:

Shri Sahab Singh Chauhan

Shri Tarvinder Singh Marwah

Shri Shoaib Igbal

The Chief Minister replied to the debate.

The following Resolution moved by the Chief Minister on the 28® July 2003 was put to vote and
adopted unanimously: “This Assembly reiterates the Motion adopted by this House on ke
September 2002 to grant statehood to Delhi. _

The House expressss its deep concern over the delay in the grant of statehood to the people of Delhi.
In order to provide more effective administration and to save the people from multiplicity of
authority causing delays and harassment to citizens the proposal for grant of Delhi’s Statehood be
finalized at the earliest.”

_ 1. Shri Arvinder Singh Lovely
2. Dr. Jagdish Mukhi
3. Dr. (Smt.) Kiran Walia
4. Shn Nand Kishore Garg
5. Shri Jile Singh Chauvhan
6.
7
8.

7.08  The House was adjourned sine-die.
PM NATIONAL ANTHEM (JAN GAN MAN)

Delhi. Siddharath Rao
29" July 2003 Secretary



