GOVERNMENT OF NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI
(DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE & LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS)
8™ LEVEL, C-WING, DELH] SECRETARIAT, NEW DELH]

No. F.14(4)/LA-2010/ tufpa [ 230 - 2 3q Dated the 22 November, 2011

To

Sub:

Sir,

Enel:

The Special Secretary (GAD),
General Administration Department,
Government of NCT of Delhi

2" Level, A-Wing,

Delhi Secretariat,

New Delhi,

Gazette Extraordinary Notification of the Ministers of the Government of
National Capital Territory of Delhi (Saiaries and Allowances) (Amendment)
Act, 2011 (Delhi Act 11 of 2011y

I am directed to forward herewith two copies of the subject cited notification
(English and Hindi versions) for publishing in the. Delhi Gazettc (Part-1V)-Extra-
Ordinary today itself. It is requested that at least 10 Gazette copies of the same may
be sent to this Department as soon as received from the press.

Yours faithfully,
As above _— fﬂ#"""

(Tarun Sahrawat)
T iddl. Secretary (Law, Justice & L.A)

No. F.14(4)/LA-2010/ lase [2 36 —5 34 Dated the 2.2 November, 201

Copy, together with the copy of enclosures, forwarded for information and necessary
action to:-

1.

The Secretary, Government of India, Ministry of Home Affairs, New Delhi-11000]
(with 5 copies),

2. The Joint Secretary & Legislative Counsel, Government of India, Ministry of Law
& Justice, Legislative Department (Correction Cell), Shastri Bhawan, New Delhi-
110001 (with 2 copies). : ' T
3. The Pr. Secretary to Lieutenant Governor, Delhi, Raj Niwas, Delhi-110054.
4. The Pr. Secretary to Chief Minister, Govt. of NCT of Delhi, Delhi Secretariat, New
Delhi-110002,
5. ThePr, Secretary (Finance), Govt. of NCT of Delhi, Delhi Secretariat, New Delhj-
110002
6. The Secretary to Minister of F inance, Govt. of NCT of Delhi, Delhi Secretariat,
L New Delhi-110002 ' '
Yy 7 T?gn{gzﬂﬂ to Chief Secretary, Govt. of NCT of Delhi, Delhi Secretariat, New Delhi-
yy 6/ The Secretary (LA), Delhi Legislative Assembly Secretariat, Old Secretariat, Delhi-
110054,

9. The Deputy Secretary (Admn.), Law, Justice and Legislative Affairs, Govt, of NCT
@-VL/“f Delhi with the request to upload a copy of the this Act on Department’s website.

(O

' T  aw?
; vtz

(Tarun Sahrawat)

\W | o ? Addl. Secretary (Law, Justice & L.A)-
W 4 _ _
< w

T
i




(TO BE PUBLISHED IN PART-IV OF THE DELHI GAZETTE-EXTRAORDINARY)

GOVERNMENT OF NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI
(DEPARTMENT -OF LAW, JUSTICE & LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS)
8™ LEVEL, C-WING, DELHI SECRETARIAT, NEW DELHI

No.F.14(4)/LA-2010/ b (a0 / 219 Dated the 22 2 November, 2011

NOTIFICATION
No.F.14(4)/LA-2010/ L fa.m/:a 19 - The following Act of the Legmlatwe Assembly of the
National Capital Terntc-r}' of Delhi received the assent of the President of India on 4"
November, 2011 and is hereby published for general information:-

“THE MINISTER OF GOVERNMENT OF NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF
DELHI (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2011
(DELHI ACT 11 OF 2011)

(As passed by the Legislative Assembly c-f the National Capital Territory of Delhi on the 5"‘
September, 2011)

[ 4" November, 201 1]

further to amend the Ministers of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi
(Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1994

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of
Delhi in the Sixty-second Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement. — {"1} This Act may be called the Ministers
of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allnwan{:es}
{(Amendment) Act, 2011.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Lieutenant Governor may, by
notification in the official Gazette, appoint.

2. Amendment of section 3. — In the Ministers of the Government of National
Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1994 (Delhi Act 8 of 1995)
(hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act™), in section 3 -

(d) in sub-section (1), for the word “ten”, the word “twenty” shall be substituted;

(e) in sub-section (2), for the words “five hundred”, the words “one thousand” shall
be substituted;

(f) in sub-section (3), for the word “eight”, the word “ﬂghteen" shall be
substituted:;

(g) in sub-section (4) for the words “thirty-five”, the word “fifty” shall be

substituted;
(h) the proviso shall be omitted. ‘ "’
3. Amendment of section 3. - In the principal Act, In section 3, for the words

“ten thousand”, the words “twenty thousand™ shall be substituted.

4, Amendment of section 6. — In the principal Act, in section 6, in sub-section
(4), for the words “one thousand”™ the words “two thousand” shall be substituted.




Qs

5. Substitution of new section for section 8. — In the principal Act, for
section 8, the following section shall be substituted, namely: - : : .

«g, Medical facilities. — A Minister and members of his family shall :

be entitled to free medical treatment and or reimbursement and free O e

ot

accommodation for the Minister and members of his family, in hospitals run
by the Government and all other panel or referral hospitals empanelled or
declared as such by the Government, in accordance with the Medical
Attendance Rules and the Delhi Government Employees Health Scheme as

ed from time to time on priority basis as av ilable to Group ‘A’

officers of the highest grade of the Government:

Provided that a compulsory monthly contribution shall be levied

- from every Minister at the same rate as would be payable by a Group-A

officer of the highest grade of the Government and such contribution shall-
be recoverable from the Monthly Salary Bill of the Minister.

) Add). Secretary (Law, Justice & L.A.)

— =

B LA




(FRreeft wroreas m7—4 sremETen #Wmmnf)ﬁ
U Yo &7 fRodt v
(R =g v Rerht sef fwm)
JTSql Te, W, Reeh wltarer, T fReecht

HOBI0 14,/04 / Tel.T—2010 / tluof219 festisp : 32 Tavaw, 2011

EIRES Gl

Ril ka0 14/64/1::?-1.1@.—2:11:}/;;@&/213_— mﬁ & AUy gRT. fsiw 04 - =
ﬂﬁm,znn.ﬁﬁ?ﬁﬂmﬁrﬁwwﬁ.mmﬁmﬁﬁﬁﬁ

wTar Bi—

(@ vd ) (weher) PR, 2011
(2011 &1 Reeh aRPr 11)

ﬁr@umﬁaﬁ%%ﬁﬁaﬁﬁmﬂwmﬁwm&rﬁm,znﬁﬁ
TYaIia) :

(04 FawR, 2011)

wﬁamﬁﬂaﬁﬁhmﬁaﬁﬁﬁﬂﬁﬁﬂﬂi iz, 1004 T G W
T B fore afdfr .

Wwaﬁwﬁa&ﬁw@umﬂﬁr&af&ﬁﬁaﬁmm i E

f=fofea wu ¥ a8 sfdfrafie o —

1 Wl i w@ . — (1) s oRPE a1 Wl s o e
ﬁﬁm%ﬂﬁ{ﬁﬁ?ﬂmnﬁ}(ﬂ@m}mﬁrﬁm,mﬂh
() 98 IU-IToUUIel gRT WEN e ¥ -t g aonfiag Ry @

WHTET BT | :

2. mamm:—mﬂmmwwﬁﬁ%wnﬁ}
mﬁﬁmmgm{waawﬁ:ﬁﬁmﬁmﬂa}mm'&ﬁaﬁlﬁm"%m
# weffa) & amr 3 & — _

() mm[ﬂﬁw“av‘%wmw"ﬁﬂ"ﬂﬁw%wﬁﬁﬁwml

Tl Sl Wl 8 0% | B ML (T p T TR ——




(=)

(m
(&)

()

ww{z}#m"mﬂﬁ'fﬁmwm'wm“ wierenfie fasar |-
STHRT (3) ¥ w1 “3MC” & I W W “woRE” e R oo,
SUENT (4) ¥ e a?wmmmz "ilirl'ﬁ wiereenfia foby oo
TP B ESIAT ST |

Wﬁﬂ’ﬂﬂ!ﬁﬂ?—ﬂﬁﬁﬁﬁ'&ﬂﬁﬂ&ﬁmﬁ " BN B WH
W T A g wferenfa vy wmor |

ST 6 B WA ey o unT 6 A swwN (@) ¥ amw v uw
FR' @ WM W WK 2 g P g frar wre)

ma%mwﬁ.ﬂﬁmm:—wmaﬁwaﬁmﬁ’-

W FreRem o v @ oo, s -

"8. Tafthoar glmmg — Eﬂa‘ﬂﬂ‘rﬁwmwﬁa—n%mﬁwﬁm

Wﬂmuﬁmﬁa}waﬁmwﬁwﬁaﬁigﬁ T B
mﬁﬁﬁmmmmw-mwmﬁﬁm
WWWMWWWTW%WW
mﬂﬂrﬁ‘mmﬁﬁnﬁﬁﬁﬁemwmﬁamﬁmﬂw
Wqﬁawmmﬁgﬁﬁmmqﬁml

ST & 5 WPR B Touon 9% B qu T e gRY P A

ﬁﬁwmﬁﬂwwwmmwﬂmm
ﬁﬁmﬁ?ﬁ%ﬂﬁﬁﬂﬂmﬁfﬁﬁmmr

e Hcla

sfiRax e (Y, = vd Rurd )




TO BE PUBLISHED IN PART-IV OF THE DELHI GAZETTE-EXTRAORDINARY)

GOVERNMENT OF NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI
(DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE & LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS)
8™ LEVEL, C-WING, DELHI SECRETARIAT, NEW DELHI

No. F.14(4)/LA-2010/ telred [2449 - 2873 Dated theZ November, 2011
NOTIFICATION

No. F.14(4)/LA-2010/k{aw" !’r -5 FIn exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (2) of
section | of the Ministers of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries
and Allowances) (Amendment) Act, 2011 (Delhi Act 11 of 2011), the Lieutenant Governor of
the National Capital Territory of Delhi hereby, appoints the fourth day of November, 2011 as

the date on which the aforesaid Act shall come into force,

By order and in the name of the Lieutenant Governor
of the National Capital Territory of Delhi,

c«w""(:’:uﬂ

v _
(Tarun Sahrawat)
,éhddl. Secretary (Law, Justice & L.A.)

No. F.14(4YLA-2010/ ¢+ fauq 203 Dated the.23 November, 2011

Copy forwarded for information to:-

1.

3.
6.

7.

The Special Secretary (GAD/Coord.), Govt. of NCT of Delhi, 2 Level, A-Wing, Delhi
Secretariat, I.P, Estate, New Delhi with two copies of English and Hindi version of this
notification for publishing in Delhi Gazette Part-IV (Extra-ordinary). It is requested that
at least 10 copies of the Gazette Notification may be sent to this Department for official
use as soon as received from the press.

The Secretary, Government of India, Ministry of Home Affairs, North Block, New
Delhi.

The Joint Secretary & Legislative Counsel, Government of India, Ministry of Law &
Justice, Legislative Department (Correction Cell), Shastri Bhawan, New Delhi.

The Pr. Secretary to the Lieutenant Governor, Delhi, Raj Niwas, Delhi-110054,

The Pr. Secretary to the Chief Minister, Govt. of NCT of Delhi, Delhi Secretariat, 1P,
Estate, New Delhi. = '

The Secretary to the Finance Minister, Govt, of NCT of Delhi, Delhi Secretariat, 1P,
Estate, New Delhi.

The OSD to the Chief Secretary, Govt. of NCT of Delhi, Delhi Secretariat, New Delhi,

\}/I‘he Secretary (LA.) Delhi Legislative Assembly Secretariat, Old Secretariat, Delhi-

9.

110054.
The Deputy Secretary (Admn.), Law, Justice and Legislative Affairs, Govt. of NCT of
Delhi with the request to upload a copy of the this Act on Department’s website.

- .
it Ve O

-n., o ——xtalh
(Tarun Sahrawat)
@\Md f’/é__ﬁddl. Secretary (Law, Justice & L.A.)




(ool JroTos ammRoT & wrr — |V H yarerref)

ISy auEr 87 R swer
(Rfer, =g vd e &, famrr)
gl o, W, Reeh ey, =2 fawelt —110002

WHo w10 14{4};’m—2umxwﬁaﬁ/mq -%F ﬁ:‘aﬁ*ﬂiw* 2011

W0 W10 14(4) / TeTU—2011 / Qerdisit /244 ~2157F - T weuE & Reh wer @ w4
(@ T3 W) (HorE) aRfEE 2019 {2011aﬂféﬁﬁwﬁrﬁmﬁ}aﬁmm1aﬁmam(2)
mwﬁ!ﬁﬁﬁmuﬁmaﬂa?w@ﬁmﬂaﬁﬁﬁ%m4m 2011 Tod
AR @7 wgw B A A Aifeg w

w0 W0 14(4) / Te19—2010 / Toreielt /241 4 W | . feqi@ L2 7amr, 2011

nﬁ%ﬁﬁmaﬁwﬁqﬁmm%@mﬁﬁ:-

1, HWWWWHWKWLWW%MWH%W
aﬁﬁmwﬁwﬁ&-ﬁmﬁmﬁﬂmﬁ&gﬂa$mﬁimaﬂ
100fal g9 T @1 wrfey warmef a9

2. W@, 9RT AWR, T8 AR, T @, T el |
oE, E voH, 98 R

4. mmﬁfﬂ,mﬂmﬁ.w@awﬁﬁaﬁﬁhw.wﬁww,ﬁﬁn

5, éﬁ%ﬂﬁﬂ,ﬁ@ﬁﬁ,ﬂ@ﬁmﬁ%ﬂﬁﬁmﬁﬁﬁﬁm.mﬁuw,ﬁ'

[ . ==

8. %ﬁﬁﬁ,?@ﬁmﬁﬁﬁw,ﬁﬁﬁm.ﬂﬂﬁﬂm,ﬂé

|

7. g:{;ﬁﬁﬁﬁmﬁqwmﬂiﬁﬁﬁw,ﬁﬁﬁm.muﬁﬂ

, % fRwel |

8. wf¥E (Tem), feeeh Rerrerar wRraTers, wr witrare, fieeh—110054

9. mmmmmwwmwiwmmmwm
mmwm@mgm -

( T WeraT )
o7y IR e (R, < v R )




