o €. Si.ue.- 33002/99

REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99

HILT GLHRTL
GOVERNMEN T OF INDIA

Delhi @azette

TH.S.-3.Ud.-31.-07012022-232499
SG-DL-E-07012022-232499

HATETIT
EXTRAORDINARY

IR & THAT

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 1] fReelt, AR, S 3, 202240 13,1943 [aaa R g 350
No. 1] DELHI, MONDAY, JANUARY 3, 2022/PAUSHA 13, 1943 [N. C. T. D. No. 350

W IV
PART IV

THT TOETHT o & et g
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI

feeeht fAum 9w 9fare
RIPKCE]
feoel, 3 SFaRT, 2022

B1. . 21/8 /@ /2022 / vawga—VII / fagmdt / 0626 —=fiRad & Gda@eRT & SHART &
fore waiRra fopam Sirar & —

faeetT for g (Herre) fargrs, 2022
[22 &1 fagas dwai® 01]
(==t for spegme arferfeas, 1971 # oy Herres # form)
T
IECRET

AT TUTSH & agTa¥a a4 § g et & et it e 797 g =5 [uga atafaata G
ST -

1. gfer s, faea @ wiw- (1) 7 aferfaay feeeht e g (Ferrem) f&rame, 2022 Fgam |

16 DG/2022 (1)



2 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV]

(2) g FFYOT I TSI e et # faearia grm

(3) TE THTA THTH | AT T |

2. TR 4 FT GLMe - faeelt g [egmer stfaf@=m, 1971 (1971 #7 82), § 9T 4 % @< (W) ¥, -
(i) "7 FEEIT " QTERT o T U "TH HEEd| " grEat A wiaeeniua R S

(ii) &TT 4 F @ (F) F IT-G< (ii) H,-

() "FTT AEEA" OTsET F TAT I "I qEEA oreat & At e S,

(@) "TAT" 95 FT FETAT STUAT;

(M) "ot T FIT AT, AIGE", Teal & TATq " T4T (5) o T&d THIHT igd, AAGS! g, AT, Tora"
STSET, FIYHT TAT oih T Tty o sruwm)
e X FRON T fAaxr

1. faeett o e wegs gl & wiaeed a¥ “ff aed swedAT A1fed, aaas! |1y, wieer (45e)” &
Tr=d "TEd" | AT A % 3597 § faoet! (fra TeamT dfafaaw, 1971 # derred Hii SaeaFhidl 3caq g5 &

| faeeft R g wegs gtafa F gfdess  fF=m #29 F forw WP(C) |w=ar 6377/2018 F A9« |

AW 3¢ =TT fSott & g faqiw 01.06.2018 F saer i Rawar § U< afaf==a § qeree
ERIel

THE SFATAT “AT TEd THIHT IR, AAGST |1 , WIEST (ITE)” T Ii=4 ded ® €T § g HATAT, ATLA
TeaTe g faATs 23.04.1999 &1 AT ATAT=AT & #1.31.281(2) F sqae e pegmr sfafaaw, 1925
(1925 1 gsrar srferfa=a VI F sfaeid omiHe 6T T g |

2. faeeht T spegmr sfarfaam, 1971 a7 4 % 3u-9E (i), @< (1) & yraen § & afafa § =¥ e
givr, ey g af givn - (1) = o aeq Aarted, dgaas (2) #ff T g Aiied, AHal
(3) it T TeAT AT, TeAT 37T (4) =T T FoL ATl TieE|

3. U IS & ST Here 30 e o forg searfag a9 faeet o qegmer sfaf=as, 1971 #it gy
4 % 39T (i) F @ (A) grT B 7U et Fafoted g -

(i) srterf@ae 7 a4 % g2 (A) |, AT TeET” 905 % T T T qeA) 9758 T T

(if) &7 4 F @E (A1) F 3= (i) H, -

(F) " TEEA" 9T5aT o I 9T "7 987" 9758 T S0

(1) ez "siz" T ger faa ST,

(¥1) "It TET T[T ATfed, ARES" MRl F d1g, 5T HIGH AT dF "I (5) off qed IAIHT Aled, qAaST
qrar, AT, T STAT ST

4. e IUH I29AT 1 ITH Fe T TATH F2dT 2l

IEGIEE

ST -



[PART IV DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY 3

ERIBHEGEER R R Rk B Rk

et g [egmer (Ferre) fErdae, 2022 fFft | srefiaesr gttt it e & sfaies afw
TR Al FHdT gl

EnIREIEG]

feeett forg egmr (Fene) f@ders, 2022 # Tgrr Tt e fReet & aateg Ay & a2 fa<ig
Rfzare et 721 21

TTSIE 9T, WAH HAT, [EETT 19 AemaT

TS FHT, F=E

LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION
Delhi, the 3rd January, 2022
F. No. 21/8/Sikh/2022/LAS-VII/Leg./626.—The following is published for general Information:—
THE DELHI SIKH GURUDWARAS (AMENDMENT) BILL
(BILL No. 01 of 2022)
A
BILL-2022
further to amend the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971.

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the Seventieth second
of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title, extent and commencement.-(1) This Act may be called the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras (Amendment) Act,
2022.

(2) It extends to the whole of the National Capital Territory of Delhi.
(2) It shall come into force with immediate effect.
2. Amendment of Section 4 — In the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971 (82 of 1971), in clause (b) of Section 4,--------—-
(1) for the words “nine members”, the words “ten members” shall be substituted;
(i1) In sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of Section 4,-----
(a) for the words “four members”, the words “five members”shall be substituted,
(b) the word “and” shall be omitted;

(¢) after the words “Sri Takhat Hazur Sahib, Nanded”, the words brackets and figure “and (5) Sri Takhat Damdama
Sahib, Talwandi Sabo, Bhatinda, Punjab” shall be inserted.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

1. The need for the amendment in the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971, arises out of representation of the Delhi
Sikh Gurdwaras Management Committee for inclusion of ‘Sri Takhat Damdama Sahib, Talwandi Sabo,
Bhatinda (Punjab)’ as fifth “Takhat” in the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971 by making amendment in the said
Act and in continuation to the order dated 01.06.2018 by the Delhi High Court in the matter of W.P.(C) No.
6377/2018 for considering the representation of The Delhi Sikh Gurdwara Management Committee.

Further, ’Sri Takhat Damdama Sahib, Talwandi Sabo, Bhatinda (Punjab)’has already been included as the fifth
Takhat in the Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1925 (Punjab Act VIII of 1925) by the Ministry of Home Affairs, Govt. of
India vide notification NO. S.O. 281(E) dated 23.04.1999.



4 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV]

2. Sub-clause (ii), clause (b) of Section 4 of the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971 provides that the committee
shall consist of four members, each being the head priest of the (1) Sri Akal Takhat Sahib, Amritsar (2) Sri
Takhat Kesgarh Sahib, Anandpur (3) Sri Takhat Patna Sahib, Patna and (4) Sri Takhat Hazur Sahib, Nanded.

3. In the above background appropriate amendments are proposed to be made and clause (b) in sub-clause (ii) of
Section 4 of the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971 by making the following amendments as under:-

(1) In clause (b) of Section 4 of the Act, of the words ‘nine members’ the words ‘ten members’ shall be
substituted

(i1) In sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of Section 4, ---
(a) for the words “four Members”, the words “five members” shall be substituted.
(b) the word ““and” shall be omitted;

(c) after the words “Sri Takhat Hazur Sahib, Nanded”, the words brackets and figure “and
(5) Sri Takhat Damdama Sahib, Talwandi Sabo, Bhatinda, Punjab” shall be inserted.

4. The Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.
Date:-
Place:-

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

The Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras (Amendment) Bill, 2022 does not seek to confer any power of legislation on any
subordinate functionaries.

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

The Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras (Amendment) Bill, 2022 does not involve any financial implications from the
Consolidation Fund of the National Capital Territory of Delhi.

RAJENDRA PAL GAUTAM, Minister of Directorate of Gurdwara Elections

RAJ KUMAR, Secy.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. SURENDER Digitaly slgried by SURENDER

MAHADASAM

MAHADASAM Date: 2022.01.07 22:27:02 40530



