
1603 DG/2023 (1) 

रजिस्ट्री स.ं डी.एल.- 33002/99                                                                                                                                  REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99 

 

 

xxxGIDHxxx 
xxxGIDExxx 

असाधारण 
EXTRAORDINARY 

प्राजधकार स ेप्रकाजित 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

 

भाग IV 

PART IV 

राष्ट्रीय रािधानी राज्य क्षते्र दिल्ली सरकार 
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI 

 

fnYyh] 9 ekpZ] 2023 

dsadvice/103-111.—Hkkjr ds jk"Vªifr }kjk fnukad 14 Qjojh] 2023 dks 

feyh lgefr ds i'pkr~ jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh dh fo/kkulHkk dk fuEufyf[kr vf/kfu;e tulk/kkj.k dh lwpukFkZ 

çdkf'kr fd;k tkrk gS%&  

4 tqykÃ 2022 dks jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh dh fo/kkulHkk }kjk ;Fkk ikfjr½   

[9th March, 2023] 

jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh ljdkj ds ea=h ¼osru ,oa HkÙks½ vf/kfu;e] 1994 dk iqu% la'kks/ku djus ds fy, 

vf/kfu;e A Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds frgRrjosa o"kZ esa jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh dh fo/kkulHkk }kjk  fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g 

vf/kfu;fer gks %& 

 ¼1½ bl vf/kfu;e dks jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYYkh ljdkj ds ea=h ¼osru ,oa HkŸks½ 

¼la'kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2023 dgk tk;sxkA 

स.ं   73]  दिल्ली,  िकु्रवार, मार्च 10, 2023/फाल् गनु 19, 1944 [रा.रा.रा.क्ष.ेदि. स.ं 513 

No. 73]   DELHI,  FRIDAY, MARCH 10, 2023/PHALGUNA 19, 1944 [N. C. T. D. No. 513 

 

भारत सरकार 

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA 

     

एस.जी.-डी.एल.-अ.-10032023-244252
SG-DL-E-10032023-244252



2 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV] 

¼2½ ;g mi&jkT;iky }kjk 'kkldh; jkti= esa vf/klwpuk }kjk ;Fkkfu;r frfFk ls izòÙk gksxkA 

  jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYYkh ljdkj eas ea=h ¼osru ,oa HkŸks½ vf/kfu;e] 1994 ¼1995 dk 

fnYyh vf/kfu;e 8½ ¼blds i'pkr ^^ewy vf/kfu;e** ds :i esa lanfHkZr½ dh /kkjk 3 esa & 

¼d½ mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa ^^chl gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^lkB gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼[k½ mi/kkjk ¼2½ esa ^^,d gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^,d gtkj ikap lkS #i;s** 'kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k 

tk,xk( 

¼x½ mi/kkjk ¼3½ esa ^^vBkjg gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^rhl gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼?k½ mi/kkjk ¼4½ esa ^^ipkl gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^,d yk[k #i;s** 'kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼³½ mi/kkjk ¼4½ ds i'pkr~ fuEufyf[kr mi/kkjk dks lfUufo’V fd;k tk,xk( vFkkZr& 

^^¼5½ izR;sd dk;Zdky ds fy, lnL; ds :i izR;sd ea=h dks ySiVkWi] O;fDrxr daI;wVj] fizaVj] eksckby gSaMlsV 

bR;kfn dh [kjhn gsrq ,dckjxh HkRrs ds :i esa dqy ,d yk[k #i;s Hkqxrku fd;k tk,xkA 

¼6½ izR;sd ea=h dks lfpoh; lgk;rk ds :i esa izfr ekg dqy iPphl gtkj #i;s dk Hkqxrku fd;k tk,xkA**   

- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 4 esa ^^pkj gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nl gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa 

dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

 

¼i½ mi/kkjk ¼4½ esa ^^nks gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nl gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼ii½  mi/kkjk 4 ds i'pkr~ fuEufyf[kr mi/kkjk dks lfUufo’V fd;k tk,xk( vFkkZr& 

^^¼5½ ,d ea=h lnL; ds :i esa vius dk;Zdky ds Hkhrj ,d okgu dh [kjhn gsrq ckjg yk[k #i;s rd dk 

izfrns; vfxze okgu jkf'k ysus ds fy, ik= gksxkA  

 ¼6½ mi/kkjk 5 esa lanfHkZr vfxze gsrq C;kt nj rFkk mldh olwyh dk rjhdk jk’Vªifr ds iwoZ vuqeksnu ls 

ljdkj }kjk fu/kkZfjr fd;k tk,xkA**   

Hkjr ikjk'kj] iz/kku lfpo ¼fof/k] U;k; ,oa fo/kk;h dk;ZZ½ 

 

 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS 

NOTIFICATION 

Delhi, the 9th March, 2023 

F. 14(69)/LA-2020/dsadvice/103-111—The following Act of the Legislative Assembly of the 

National Capital Territory of Delhi received the assent of the President of India on 14
th

 February, 2023 and is hereby 

published for general information:- 

“THE MINISTERS OF THE GOVERNMENT OF NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI 

(SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2023” 

(DELHI ACT NO. 03 OF 2023) 

(As passed by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi on 4th July, 2022). 

[9
th

 March, 2023] 

An Act further to amend the Ministers of the Government of the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and 

Allowances) Act, 1994. 

 Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the Seventy-third 

Year of the Republic of India as follows:- 

1. Short title and commencement. - (1) This Act may be called the Ministers of the Government of National 

Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Act, 2023. 

(2)   It shall come into force on such date as the Lieutenant Governor may, by notification in the Official 

Gazette, appoint. 

2.    Amendment of section 3. – In the Ministers of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries 

and Allowances) Act, 1994, (Delhi Act 8 of 1995) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 3,- 



[PART IV DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY 3 

  
(a) in sub-section (1), for the words  “twenty thousand rupees”, the words  “sixty thousand rupees” shall be 

substituted; 

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words  “one thousand five hundred rupees” 

shall be substituted; 

(c) in sub-section (3), for the words “eighteen thousand rupees”, the words  “thirty thousand rupees” shall be 

substituted; 

(d) in sub-section (4), for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the words “one lakh rupees” shall be substituted; 

(e) after sub-section (4), the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely; -  

“(5) There shall be paid to each Minister a sum of rupees one lakh as one time allowance for purchase of 

laptop, personal computer, printer, mobile handset etc. for each term of office as a Member. 

(6) There shall be paid to each Minister a sum of rupees twenty five thousand per month as secretarial 

assistance.”  

3.  Amendment of section 4. –In the principal Act, in section 4, for the words “four thousand rupees” the words 

“ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

4. Amendment of section 6.-  

(i) In sub-section (4), for the words “rupees two thousand rupees”, the words  “rupees ten thousand” shall 

be substituted 

(ii) After sub-section (4) the following sub-sections shall be inserted. – 

“(5) A Minister shall be entitled to a conveyance advance up to twelve lakh rupees for purchase of 

conveyance to be repayable within his term as a Member. 

(6) The rate of interest for the advance referred to in sub-section (5) and the mode of recovery thereon 

shall be such as may be determined by the Government, with the prior approval of the President.” 

BHARAT PARASHAR, Principal Secy. (Law, Justice & Legislative Affairs) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064 

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. 



1611 DG/2023 (1) 

रजिस्ट्री स.ं डी.एल.- 33002/99                                                                                                                                  REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99 

 

 

xxxGIDHxxx 
xxxGIDExxx 

असाधारण 
EXTRAORDINARY 

प्राजधकार स ेप्रकाजित 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

 

भाग IV 

PART IV 

राष्ट्रीय रािधानी राज्य क्षते्र दिल्ली सरकार 
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI 

 

fnYyh] 9 ekpZ] 2023 

dsadvice/149-157.—jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYYkh ljdkj ds ea=h 

¼osru ,oa HkŸks½ ¼la'kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] „å„… ¼„å„… dk fnYyh vf/kfu;e å…½ dh èkkjk 1 dh mièkkjk ¼2½ }kjk çnÙk 

'kfä;ksa dk ç;ksx djrs gq,] jk"Vªh; jktèkkuh {ks= fnYyh ds mijkT;iky] 14 Qjojh] 2023 mä vfèkfu;e dks 

ço`r gksus dh frfFk fuf'pr djrs gSa A 

fnYyh jk"Vªh; jktèkkuh ds mijkT;iky  

ds vkns'k ls vkSj muds uke ij] 

Hkjr ikjk'kj] iz/kku lfpo 

 

 

 

स.ं   78]  दिल्ली,  िकु्रवार, मार्च 10, 2023/फाल् गनु 19, 1944 [रा.रा.रा.क्षे.दि. स.ं 518 

No. 78]   DELHI,  FRIDAY, MARCH 10, 2023/PHALGUNA 19, 1944 [N. C. T. D. No. 518 

 

भारत सरकार 

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA 

     

एस.जी.-डी.एल.-अ.-11032023-244271
SG-DL-E-11032023-244271



2 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV] 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS 

NOTIFICATION 

Delhi, the 9th March, 2023 

No. F. 14(69)/LA-2020/dsadvice/149-157.—In exercise of the powers conferred by the sub-section (2) of 

section 1 of the Ministers of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances) 

(Amendment) Act, 2023 (Act No. 3 of 2023), the Lieutenant Governor of the National Capital Territory of Delhi 

hereby, appoints 14th February, 2023 as the date on which the aforesaid Act shall come into force. 

By Order and in the Name of the Lieutenant Governor  

of the National Capital Territory of Delhi, 

BHARAT PARASHAR, Principal Secy. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064 

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. 


		2023-03-11T09:53:49+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




