TRt 9. S.ue.- 33002/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99

AT LRI
GOVERNMENT OF INDIA

Velhi @azette

TS, -31.Ucl.-37.-10032023-244 252
SG-DL -E-10032023-244252

STETYTIT
EXTRAORDINARY

TIARTE o THRTTAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 73] feetl, AT, WTH 10, 2023/FTR[T 19, 1944 o fR € 513
No. 73] DELHI, FRIDAY, MARCH 10, 2023/PHALGUNA 19, 1944 [N.C. T.D. No.513

T 1V
PART IV

TET LT ST &7 fiwslt 9
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI

faftr, =g vq fagrft «rd faumr
CIPKCE]
faoell, 9 9/, 2023

. BT 14(69) / TaU—3030 /dsadvice/103-111.—9Rd & Igafad gRT G 14 HRaN, 2023 Bl
el |eAfd & uverq ISR Sl a7 fSeell @ e &1 FrfeiRed e SemeRer o e
1T fbar Sirar g—

IS T g7 fieel! WReR @ w3l (a9 vd W) (ened) afSfs, 03
(033 &1 faeedl fAf—H 03)
4 SJEITS 2022 PI TSR RIS &5 faeell S [Aeraa«r gRT J2r aiika)

[9™ March, 2023]

ISR o & fQeell WRGR & HA1 (99 Ud ) ARFRE, 1994 BT T WA BRI D (oY
ARfFRM | R TR & fagaRd 99 # I o o fieelt @ furer grr fEforfad v # uw
rffrafya 8 —

1 dftrq e va yRw — (1) 39 A & I o 89 Aol WReR @ #Al (a9 Td W)
(M) SNfSf=rH, 2023 HET STRATT |

1603 DG/2023 1)




2 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV]

(2) IT SURTIUTA GRT ARAHII U= H AEGAAT §RT Jii~raa [y & uger gnm |

2 ORI 3 T MG L JoRI &5 ool IWAR # #3 (@a9 vd 7)) AfAfm, 1994 (1995 &
faeetl 1™ 8) (3@ Ueand “qo ARF" & wU # Hafid) & gR_1 3 H —

(@) SUIRT (1) § 9N BOIR ¥9Y” T@&] & I R S BOR U Il BT gfoRenfa fbar o,
(@) STIRT (2) § "Udh OIR $UY" ¥@&I & WM R “UH g9R UE Al 9" el & yforenfua fear
SITQAT;

(") SUIRT (3) H "3M6RE TOR TUY TGl & WIH W U TR $YI” &l Pl ufcenfua faar Sirgem:
(€) SUIRT (4) § U9 EOIR $UY" Vel & XA R “TH oIRF U Ieai bT wlawenfid fear sme;
() SUIRT (4) & uwar fFr=falRad SUaRT &1 |fsfdse faHar g, srerid—

"(6) TS BRIGIA & foU 9e® & WU UASG FAl B oUeH, fead dEer, e, Aasd dede
SN B WIE 8g YhaRT 9l & ©U § ol U oIRg SUY YA fBdT ST |

(6) ISP HA Bl AT FEIA B WU H URT HIE Hof Tead SR S BT YA {HAT ST |

3. ORT 4 T GG —Jd IMARH P gRT 4 § IR §OAR IR &I & WM W "TH F9R 9" &l
H1 uforenfid fasar e,

4. ORI 6 BT AUAET —
(i) SUURT (4) % "< IR W TG} & W W "SH TOIR TSI ¥} BT yforenfia faar S
(i) SUERT 4 & g FEfaRad SUURT &1 AfFfase faar SIrgem; sierid—

“(5) Tb WA W B BU H AU BRIBI B AR Y dred Pl WNIG 8 dNE oA B qh Bl
gfcrer 31 ares I o @ forg o= g |

(6) SUERT 5 ¥ HaRid I Bg NI &R AT ISP el HT dIBI LA & Yd JgAreT |
WRHR gRT AR fbar Smeem |

TRA URRR, va e (A, =g va femd &ri)

DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
Delhi, the 9th March, 2023

F. 14(69)/LA-2020/dsadvice/103-111—The following Act of the Legislative Assembly of the
National Capital Territory of Delhi received the assent of the President of India on 14™ February, 2023 and is hereby
published for general information:-

“THE MINISTERS OF THE GOVERNMENT OF NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI
(SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2023”

(DELHI ACT NO. 03 OF 2023)
(As passed by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi on 4th July, 2022).
[9™ March, 2023]

An Act further to amend the Ministers of the Government of the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and
Allowances) Act, 1994,

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the Seventy-third
Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1.  Short title and commencement. - (1) This Act may be called the Ministers of the Government of National
Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Act, 2023.

(2) 1t shall come into force on such date as the Lieutenant Governor may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, appoint.

2. Amendment of section 3. — In the Ministers of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries
and Allowances) Act, 1994, (Delhi Act 8 of 1995) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 3,-



[PART IV DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY 3

(@ in sub-section (1), for the words “twenty thousand rupees”, the words “sixty thousand rupees” shall be
substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “one thousand five hundred rupees”
shall be substituted;

(¢) insub-section (3), for the words “eighteen thousand rupees”, the words “thirty thousand rupees” shall be
substituted;

(d) insub-section (4), for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the words “one lakh rupees” shall be substituted;
(e) after sub-section (4), the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely; -

“(5) There shall be paid to each Minister a sum of rupees one lakh as one time allowance for purchase of
laptop, personal computer, printer, mobile handset etc. for each term of office as a Member.

(6) There shall be paid to each Minister a sum of rupees twenty five thousand per month as secretarial
assistance.”

3. Amendment of section 4. —In the principal Act, in section 4, for the words “four thousand rupees” the words
“ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

4.  Amendment of section 6.-

(i) In sub-section (4), for the words “rupees two thousand rupees”, the words “rupees ten thousand” shall
be substituted

(ii) After sub-section (4) the following sub-sections shall be inserted. —

“(5) A Minister shall be entitled to a conveyance advance up to twelve lakh rupees for purchase of
conveyance to be repayable within his term as a Member.

(6) The rate of interest for the advance referred to in sub-section (5) and the mode of recovery thereon
shall be such as may be determined by the Government, with the prior approval of the President.”

BHARAT PARASHAR, Principal Secy. (Law, Justice & Legislative Affairs)

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- 110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. o :




TRt 9. S.ue.- 33002/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99
HILT GIAhIT

Velhi zette

TH. 3. -31.0cl.-37.-11032023-244271
SG-DL-E-11032023-244271

JYTETI
EXTRAORDINARY

BN EIEE: R EAET

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 78] faeeft, SphaT, AT 10, 2023/FTRT 19, 1944 [raaaf € 518
No. 78] DELHI, FRIDAY, MARCH 10, 2023/PHALGUNA 19, 1944 [N.C. T.D. No.518

| IV
PART IV

TE T T & et aahe
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELH]I

fafer, =g w9 faumrf +=~f fawmr
FferegaT
e, 9 4™, 2023

. BT 14(69) / Td¥—3030 /dsadvice/149-157 —TERT ISl & fieell WRAGR & #3Al
(@9 T W) (e I, 203 (R03 BT facell AMRIFTH 03) B ORT 1 B SWRT (2) §RT Ued
SIRFAT BT TRART BRI BY, IS T &7 fQoell & IURTSHUTA, 14 HRAR], 2023 I ARRH Bl
Uqd B @ Al [Afted & 2 |

faeell IS ISE & SURTSIATA
P MY | 3R S9d 9H W,

WA URIER, YL i

1611 DG/2023 @)



DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART V]

DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
Delhi, the 9th March, 2023

No. F. 14(69)/LA-2020/dsadvice/149-157.—In exercise of the powers conferred by the sub-section (2) of
section 1 of the Ministers of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances)
(Amendment) Act, 2023 (Act No. 3 of 2023), the Lieutenant Governor of the National Capital Territory of Delhi

hereby, appoints 14th February, 2023 as the date on which the aforesaid Act shall come into force.
By Order and in the Name of the Lieutenant Governor
of the National Capital Territory of Delhi,

BHARAT PARASHAR, Principal Secy.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. oxumss



		2023-03-11T09:53:49+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




