TRt 9. S.ue.- 33002/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99

AT LRI
GOVERNMENT OF INDIA

Velhi @azette

TGS -31.0cl.-37.-10032023-244 251
SG-DL -E-10032023-244251

STETYTIT
EXTRAORDINARY

TIARTE o THRTTAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 74] faett, AT, AT 10, 2023/ BTR[T 19, 1944 ok € 514
No. 74] DELHI, FRIDAY, MARCH 10, 2023/ PHALGUNA 19, 1944 [N. C.T.D. No.514

T 1V
PART IV

TET LT ST &7 fiwslt 9
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI

faftr, =g vq fagrft «rd faumr
CIPKCE]
faoell, 9 9/, 2023

|. BT 14(69) / TalU—3030 /dsadvice/112-120.—9IRd & Igufad gRT fHAld 14 HRas), 2023 &l
el |eAfd & uverq ISR el F fSeel @ e &1 FrfeiRed e SemeRer a7 e
YepTfIrd fhar Sirar g—

TS g 87 et faa=aar © 9gw @+, w<d, 99 saf) (Weee) T, 013
(033 @71 feeell FfAfT o%)
4 SJEITs 2022 B TSR RIS &3 faeell $I [erTa+ gRT J21 91ika)

[9" March, 2023]

ISR IO &3 fdoell [eradr & dew (da9, W, UeF 1) AfafFH, 1994 H g GO &) &
o | RT TR & fogaRd ¥ # T o & e fau T g1 98 gy fEfaRad wu # gg
fSfafia & —

1.  dftra e vd gRa—(1) 9 fAfem & I o aF fAeel fauaw @ Aey (dad, W,
U3 ScTfe) (Heire) AfSH, 2023 HET SIRATT |

1604 DG/2023 Q)




2 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV]

(2) IT SURTUTA GRT ATHHII IISUF H ARGAAT gRT Je-raa I 31 uger 8nm |

2. ORI 3 BT AIMET — TS Ao & Reell g & de (a9, w1, e ganfe) srfafem,
1994 (1995 &1 facell IAITH 6) (S Uzamd "o IV & wU H Hafia) & aRT 3 3§ —

(@) SUEIRT (1) # —

(i) "9RE TR ¥U" Y@l & WM W "0 &R 9" &l B ufcrenfya faar S

(ii) TP TOR U VRl & WM W “TH golR Urd Al U oal B ufcrenfia faar S
SUYRT (2) § "“3MORE BOR $UY’ @l & WM R U 89K $U &l b7 yfoRenfud far
SITEET;

SUYRT (3) H "BE TOR B Il & WIFH TR “TH §9IR BU" Iea] &I ufewenfad favar swee;
SWIRT (4) § "T9 BoIR 0" ¥l & WM R UG8 g9R SUU veai $I yfoRenfud foam Smom;
SWIRT 4 & TsATq AfiRad SURT &1 Af=fase faar S, srerfa—

"(5) U® FDHIA & foY IS T DI oiyeiy, AfFaTd ey, fUier, Aasa dede, sanfe @l
ERIT &g VIR 9l & U H Bl Vb g B0 YA fbar e |
3. HRT 6 BT ALNGA —Hc JTIH Pl &gRT 6 H 3T "3 TR IWI” &I & WIH R TH BolR 30"
Y&l BT yfoRenfua e e,

4. ORI 6@ BT GAGT — T AT BT gRT 68 H AU "I BoR IWI" @I & @ R "Th AG
I Wl Bl Gl fdhar SrgEm;

5. ORI 8 ®T WG — T AMAFRH & g_7 8 & IWIRT (1) H MY IR oG R @I & R W

6. ©IRT 9 BT HIIET — Hol JRH BT gRT 9 H Y "Hd &9R U Al 30" &I & WJF W UG8
BOIR TUY" TRl Bl yfoRenfud far smem;

g

~

a4 9 3

~

TRA URRR, yae |fea ([@fd, =ma vd fqurd orf)

DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
Delhi, the 9th March, 2023

F.14 (69)/LA-2020/dsadvice/112-120—The following Act of the Legislative Assembly of the
National Capital Territory of Delhi received the assent of the President of India on 14™ February, 2023 and is hereby
published for general information:-

“THE MEMBERS OF LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF
DELHI (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES, PENSION, ETC.) AMENDMENT) ACT, 2023”

(DELHI ACT NO. 04 OF 2023)
(As passed by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi on 4th July, 2022).
[9™ March, 2023]

An Act further to amend the Members of the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi
(Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) Act, 1994.

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the Seventy-third
year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the Members of the Legislative Assembly of the
National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) (Amendment) Act, 2023.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Lieutenant Governor may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, appoint.



[PART IV DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY 3

2. Amendment of section 3. — In the Members of the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of
Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) Act, 1994, (Delhi Act 06 of 1995) (hereinafter referred to as the principal
Act), in section 3, —

(@) insub-section (1)-
(i) for the words “twelve thousand rupees”, the words “thirty thousand rupees”, shall be substituted;

(if) for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “one thousand five hundred rupees”, shall be
substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “eighteen thousand rupees”, the words “twenty five thousand rupees”,
shall be substituted;

(c) in sub-section (3), for the words “six thousand rupees”, the words “ten thousands rupees”, shall be
substituted,;

(d) in sub- section (4), for the words “ten thousand rupees”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees”, shall be
substituted,;

(e) after sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely.-

“(5) There shall be paid to each Member a sum of rupees one lakh as one time allowance for purchase of
laptop, personal computer, printer, mobile handset etc. for each term of office.”.

3. Amendment in section 6. — In the principal Act, in section 6, for the words “eight thousand rupees”, the words
“ten thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.

4. Amendment in section 6A.- In the principal Act, in section 6A, for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the
words “one lakh rupees”, shall be substituted;

5.  Amendment in section 8. — In the principal Act, in section 8, in sub-section (1), for the words, “four lakh
rupees”, the words “eight lakh rupees”, shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of section 9. — In the principal Act, in section 9, for the words “seven thousand five hundred
rupees”, the words, “fifteen thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.

BHARAT PARASHAR, Principal Secy. (Law, Justice & Legislative Affairs)

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.  uwosuunr




TRt 9. S.ue.- 33002/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99
HILT GIAhIT

Velhi zette

TH.S.-31.0cl.-37.-11032023-244272
SG-DL-E-11032023-244272

JYTETI
EXTRAORDINARY

TIARTE o THRTTAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 79 faeeft, SphaT, AT 10, 2023/FTRT 19, 1944 [raaafR €. 519
No. 79] DELHI, FRIDAY, MARCH 10, 2023/PHALGUNA 19, 1944 [N.C. T.D. No.519

| IV
PART IV

TE T T & et aahe
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELH]I

fafer, =g w9 faumrf +=~f fawmr

FferegaT
faeetl, o #Td, 2023
. W 14(69) / TdAU—3030 /dsadvice/158-166.—IT g ol &3 fieell faumam @
e (dad, W, veH enf]) (Wuee) orfif™, 2023 (2023 @1 ool SR 4) @ aRT 1 @Y

SULRT (2) ERT UG hAT BT TART B 8T, IS GG &7 fdeell & SURISAUTA, 14 HRAR], 2023
Ih AfAEH B vgd B @1l [f¥ed exd € |

facell I ISET & SURTSIUTA
P AR I IR I9b 99 W,

TRA URRR, YL Al

1612 DG/2023 @)



2 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART V]

DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
Delhi, the 9th March, 2023

No. F. 14(69)/LA-2020/dsadvice/158-166.—In exercise of the powers conferred by the sub-section (2) of
section 1 of the Members of Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances,
Pension, etc.) (Amendment) Act, 2023 (Act No. 4 of 2023), the Lieutenant Governor of the National Capital Territory
of Delhi hereby, appoints 14th February, 2023 as the date on which the aforesaid Act shall come into force.

By Order and in the Name of the Lieutenant Governor
of the National Capital Territory of Delhi,

BHARAT PARASHAR, Principal Secy.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- 110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. mwosxuusr




		2023-03-11T09:55:26+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




