o 4. .uw.- 33002/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99

AT L1
GOVERNMENT OF INDIA

Delhi @azette

TS -31.0el.-31.-25062025-264144
SG-DL -E-25062025-264144

ETETLT
EXTRAORDINARY

i & THTfora

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

q. 185] foeett, TEER, 7 24, 2025/397E 3, 1947 [aaafe g 103
No. 185] DELHI, TUESDAY, JUNE 24, 2025/ASHADHA 3, 1947 [N. C. T. D. No. 103

IR A%
PART IV

TP AT T & el T g

GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI

fafer, =g va faumrfy o faunr
st
fawett, 24 9, 2025

F. 14(77)/LA/2022/jtsecylaw/509-517.—¥Rd & gdfad g1 &6 17 S, 2025 &I el
AEAlT ® UL IS RIS &3 faeetl d feraar @1 FEfeiRad sy STamERer o e
yeRIRId fhar Sirar 8-

faceh R TogrT s, 2025
(2025 &7 faeel AT 03)
(04 January, 2022 I ML AT &7 faeell B =T gRT g aiRkd)

{24 [, 2025}
(feeelt R T[ogRT 1M, 1971 # oMl HeeH & forg) wh SifaifrM

4158 DG/2025
M



2 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV]

YRT TR & fOgaRd 99 § I o &5 ool faumawr grr I8 91 wu 9 erfarfeafad
foar SR —

1. G e, (R @ afd— (1) I8 e el Rg TogrT (W) «ifdf M, 2025
BEATRT |

(2) w' w9l IR ot & faeen | fawaRa g |
(3) T TchIet IWTg H AR BT |

2. 9T 4 &1 Hee— foell R TogRT o1, 1971 (1971 &7 82), H aRT 4 & T (@) #,
() "7 IR Tl & WM RS9 gedl ‘vea) $ ufoenfud fhar S,

(i) IRT 4 & Gs (@) & SU-Ts (i) H—

(@) "OR A" T@I B WWE W UMY el ekl Bl ufoeenfud fear S

(@) “dAT” T BT BT SATUT:

(M) s I BSR WIfed, Hics, &l & ygarq ‘del (5) #ff 9 SHeHT wifed, defdel 99, Wicsl,
UG TTeqi, ISPl dAT 3jd bl AT fHar S |

DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
Delhi, the 24th June, 2025

F. 14(77)/LA/2022/jtsecylaw/509-517.—The following Act of the Legislative Assembly of the National
Capital Territory of Delhi received the assent of the President of India on 17" June, 2025 and is hereby published for
general information:-

THE DELHI SIKH GURUDWARAS (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2025
(ACT No. 03 of 2025)
(As passed by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi on 4th January, 2022).
[24 June, 2025]
An Act further to amend the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971.

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the Seventy sixth year of the
Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title, extent and commencement.-(1) This Act may be called the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras (Amendment)
Act. 2025.

(2) It extends to the whole of the National Capital Territory of Delhi.

(2) It shall come into force with immediate effect.

2. Amendment of Section 4 - In the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971 (82 of 1971), in clause (b) of Section 4.
(1) for the words "nine members", the words "ten members" shall be substituted;

(i1) In sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of Section 4,

(a) for the words "four members", the words "five members"shall be substituted;

(b) the word "and" shall be omitted:

(c) after the words "Sri Takhat Hazur Sahib, Nanded", the words brackets and figure "and (5) Sri Takhat Damdama
Sahib, Talwandi Sabo, Bhatinda, Punjab" shall be inserted.

MANMEET SINGH WALIA, Jt. Secy.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. KVeR CHAND:




		2025-06-25T22:32:24+0530
	KUMER CHAND MEENA




