
4158 DG/2025 

 (1) 

 

रजिस्ट्री स.ं डी.एल.- 33002/99                                                                                                                                  REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99 

 

 

xxxGIDHxxx 
xxxGIDExxx 

असाधारण 
EXTRAORDINARY 

प्राजधकार स ेप्रकाजित 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

 

भाग IV 

PART IV 

राष्ट्रीय रािधानी राज्य क्षते्र दिल्ली सरकार 
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI 

 

अजधसचूना 

दिल्ली , 24 िून, 2025 

F. 14(77)/LA/2022/jtsecylaw/509-517.––Hkkjr ds jk"Vªifr }kjk fnukad 17 twu] 2025 dks feyh 

lgefr ds i'pkr~ jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh dh fo/kkulHkk dk fuEufyf[kr vf/kfu;e tulk/kkj.k dh lwpukFkZ 

çdkf'kr fd;k tkrk gS%&  

fnYyh fl[k xq#}kjk vf/kfu;e] 2025 

¼2025 dk fnYyh vf/kfu;e 03½ 

¼04th January, 2022 dks jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh dh fo/kkulHkk }kjk ;Fkk ikfjr½                  

 {24 twu] 2025} 
 

¼fnYyh fl[k xq#}kjk vfèkfu;e] 1971 esa vkxs la'kksèku ds fy,½ एक vf/kfu;e 

स.ं   185]    दिल्ली, मगंलवार, िनू 24, 2025/आषाढ़ 3, 1947 [रा.रा.रा.क्षे.दि. स.ं 103  

No. 185]       DELHI,  TUESDAY, JUNE 24, 2025/ASHADHA 3, 1947 [N. C. T. D. No. 103  

 

भारत सरकार 

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA 

     

एस.जी.-डी.एल.-अ.-25062025-264144
SG-DL-E-25062025-264144



2 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV] 

Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds fNgÙkjosa¡ o"kZ esa jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYYkh foèkkulHkk }kjk ;g fuEu :i ls vf/kfu;fer 

fd;k tk;sxk %& 

1- laf{kIr 'kh"kZd] foLrkj ,oa çkjaHk& ¼1½ ;g vfèkfu;e fnYyh fl[k xq#}kjk ¼la'kksèku½ vf/kfu;e] 2025 

dgyk;sxk A  

¼2½ ;g lEiw.kZ jk"Vªh; jktèkkuh {ks= fnYyh esa foLrkfjr gksxk A 

¼3½ ;g rRdky çHkko esa ykxw gksxk A 

2- èkkjk 4 dk la'kksèku& fnYyh fl[k xq#}kjk vfèkfu;e] 1971 ¼1971 dk 82½] esa èkkjk 4 ds [kaM ¼[k½ esa] 

(i) ^^ukS lnL;ksa ^^ 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nl lnL;ksa ^^'kCnksa dks çfrLFkkfir fd;k tk;sxk; 

(ii) èkkjk 4 ds [kaM ¼[k½ ds mi&[kaM ¼ii½ esa-& 

¼d½ ^^pkj lnL;ksa^^ 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^ikap lnL;ksa^^ 'kCnksa dks çfrLFkkfir fd;k tk;sxk; 

¼[k½ ^^rFkk^^ 'kCn dks gVk;k tk,xk% 

¼x½ ÞJh r[r gtwj lkfgc] ukansM] 'kCnksa ds i'pkr~ ^^rFkk ¼5½ Jh r[r nenek lkfgc] ryoaMh lkcw] HkfVaMk] 

iatkc^^ 'kCnksa] dks"Bdksa rFkk vad dks lfUufo"V fd;k tk,xk A 

 euehr flag okfyvk, la;qä lfpo 

 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS  

NOTIFICATION 

Delhi, the 24th June, 2025 

F. 14(77)/LA/2022/jtsecylaw/509-517.—The following Act of the Legislative Assembly of the National 

Capital Territory of Delhi received the assent of the President of India on 17 th June, 2025 and is hereby published for 

general information:- 

THE DELHI SIKH GURUDWARAS (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2025 

(ACT No. 03 of 2025) 

(As passed by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi on 4th January, 2022). 

[24th June, 2025] 

An Act further to amend the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971. 

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the Seventy sixth year of the 

Republic of India as follows:- 

1. Short title, extent and commencement.-(1) This Act may be called the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras (Amendment)  

Act. 2025. 

(2) It extends to the whole of the National Capital Territory of Delhi. 

(2) It shall come into force with immediate effect. 

2. Amendment of Section 4 - In the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971 (82 of 1971), in clause (b) of Section 4. 

(1) for the words "nine members", the words "ten members" shall be substituted; 

(ii) In sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of Section 4, 

(a) for the words "four members", the words "five members"shall be substituted; 

(b) the word "and" shall be omitted: 

(c) after the words "Sri Takhat Hazur Sahib, Nanded", the words brackets and figure "and (5) Sri Takhat Damdama 

Sahib, Talwandi Sabo, Bhatinda, Punjab" shall be inserted. 

 

MANMEET SINGH WALIA, Jt. Secy. 

 

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064 

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. 


		2025-06-25T22:32:24+0530
	KUMER CHAND MEENA




