BILL NO. 08 OF 2015

The Delhi Value Added
Tax (2"! Amendment)
Bill, 2015

(As passed by the Legislative Assembly of the National
Capital Territory of Delhi on 30" June, 2015)



BILL NO. 08 OF 2015
THE DELHI VALUE ADDED TAX (2nd AMENDMENT) BILL, 2015
A
BILL
to further amend the Delhi Value Added Tax Act, 2004 (3 of 2005).

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of
Delhi in the Sixty-sixth year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title, extent and commencement.- (i) This Act may be called the Delhi
Value Added Tax (Second Amendment) Act, 2015.

(i) It extends to the whole of the National Capital Territory of Delhi.

(iii) It shall come into force on such date as the Government may, by
notification in the official Gazette, appoint:

Provided that different dates may be appointed for different provisions of
this Act.

2 Amendment of section 4.- In the principal Act, in section 4, in sub-section
(1).for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“(c) in respect of goods specified in the Fourth Schedule, at the rates
specified therein against the description of goods :

Provided that the rate of tax in respect of goods specified in the
Fourth Schedule shall be higher than the rate of tax applicable under
clause (e) of this sub-section but shall not be more than thirty paise in
the rupee;”.

3 Amendment of section 8.- In the principal Act, in section 8,-
(i)  in sub-section (1), for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely:-
“ (c) the previously agreed consideration for that sale has been altered by
agreement with the recipient for any reason except where a discount or
incentive is offered through a credit note after issuance of tax invoice in
respect of a sale to a registered dealer;”; and




w in sub-section (2), after clause (b), the following explanation shall be
inserted, namely:-

“Explanation : Credit notes issued on account of post sale discounts or
incentives will be independent of tax component and no adjustments in
the output tax would be required to be made.”.

4. Amendment of Section 10.-In the principal Act, in section 10,-
J for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1) Subject to sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 8, where any purchaser has
been issued with a credit note or debit note in terms of section 51 of this Act or
if he returns or rejects goods purchased, as a consequence of which the tax
credit claimed by him in any tax period in respect of which the purchase of
goods relates, becomes short or excess, he shall compensate such short or excess
by adjusting the amount of the tax credit allowed to him in respect of the tax
period in which the credit note or debit note has been issued or goods are
returned.

Explanation : While issuance of a credit note of a post sale discount or
incentive by a selling dealer, where no adjustment to output tax, as per the
provisions of sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 8 has been made, no
adjustment for reduction of input tax credit would be required by the
respective buying registered dealer.”; and

. in sub-section (5), for the starting word “Where”, the words and symbol
“Subject to sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 8 and conditions as may be
prescribed, where” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 22.- In the principal Act, in section 22, sub-section
(7) shall be omitted.
6. Amendment of section 38.- In the principal Act, in section 38, in sub-section

(5), for the words “fifteen days”, the words “forty five days” shall be substituted.
7 Amendment of section 51.- In the principal Act, in section 51, for the
starting word “Where”, the words and symbol “Subject to sub-sections (1) and (2)
of section 8, where” shall be substituted.

8. Amendment of section 86. - In the principal Act, in section 86 -

. in sub-section (5), for the words “five hundred”, the words “two
hundred” shall be substituted;




for sub-section (6),the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

“(6) If a registered dealer fails to comply with the provisions of sub-
section (2) of section 22 of this Act, he shall be liable to pay, by way of
penalty, a sum equal to two hundred rupees for every day of default
subject to a maximum of twenty five thousand rupees.”;

. in sub-section (9), for the words “five hundred”, the words “two
hundred” shall be substituted;

o in sub-section (16), for clause (b), the following  clauses shall be
substituted, namely:-

“(b) having issued a tax invoice or retail invoice, has failed to account it
correctly in his books of account; or ‘

(c) failed to issue a tax invoice or retail invoice as required under the
provisions of section 50 of this Act:” and

. in sub-section (20), the explanation shall be omitted.

9. Amendment of section 89.- In the principal Act, in section 89, in sub-section
(4), clause (c) shall be omitted.

10.  Amendment of the Fourth Schedule.- In the principal Act, for the Fourth
Schedule appended thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“ The Fourth Schedule
(see section 4)

Commodity Rate of Tax

Petroleum Products other than liquid petroleum
gas, piped natural gas, Compressed Natural Gas
and Kerosene such as

Twenty paise in
the rupee

® Naptha;

° Aviation Turbine Fuel;
J Spirit;

. Gasoline;

Furnace oil;
Wax (except petroleum wax used for




manufacture of candles);

. Mixture and combination of above
products.

Liquor (Foreign and Indian Made Foreign Liquor). Twenty paise in
the rupee

Country Liquor. Twenty paise in
the rupee

Narcotics (Bhaang). Twenty paise in
the rupee

Molasses. Twenty paise in
the rupee

Rectified Spirit. Twenty paise in
the rupee

Lottery Tickets. Twenty paise in
the rupee

Brake Fluid. Twenty paise in
the rupee

Tobacco and Gutkha, unmanufactured tobacco,
bidis and tobacco used in manufacture of bidis and
hooka tobacco

Twenty paise in
the rupee

Aerated Drinks. Twenty paise in
the rupee

Watches costing above rupees five thousand. Twenty paise in
the rupee

”

This Bill has been passed by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital

Territory of Delhi on the 30t June, 2015.
Rz

DELHI (Ram Niwas Goel)
Dated: 30t June, 2015 N _— Speaker,
Legislative Assembly of the
National Capital Territory of Delhi




BILL NO. 08 OF 2015

The Delhi Value Added
Tax (2" Amendment)
- Bill, 2015

(As introduced in the Legislative Assembly of the
National Capital Territory of Delhi on 29" June, 2015)

_OMBectt. Dethi-11. 1



BILL NO&3. OF 2015
THE DELHI VALUE ADDED TAX (2nd AMENDMENT) BILL, 2015
A
BILL

to further amend the Delhi Value Added Tax Act, 2004 (3 of
2005).

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory
of Delhi in the Sixty-sixth year of the Republic of India as follows:-

o Short title, extent and commencement.- (i) This Act may be called the
Delhi Value Added Tax (Second Amendment) Act, 2015.

(ii) It extends to the whole of the National Capital Territory of Delhi.

(iii) It shall come into force on such date as the Government may, by
notification in the official Gazette, appoint:

Provided that different dates may be appointed for different
provisions of this Act.

2 Amendment of section 4.- In the principal Act, in section 4, in sub-
section (1),for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“(c) in respect of goods specified in the Fourth Schedule, at the
rates specified therein against the description of goods:

_ Provided that the rate of tax in respect of goods specified in
the Fourth Schedule shall be higher than the rate of tax applicable
under clause (e) of this sub-section but shall not be more than
thirty paise in the rupee;”.

3. Amendment of section 8.- In the principal Act, in section 8,-
(i) in sub-section (1), for clause (c), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely:-
“ (c) the previously agreed consideration for that sale has been
altered by agreement with the recipient for any reason except where
a discount or incentive is offered through a credit note after issuance
of tax invoice in respect of a sale to a registered dealer;”; and




4.

B

(ii)  in sub-section (2), after clause (b), the following explanation shall be

inserted, namely:-

“Explanation : Credit notes issued on account of post sale discounts
or incentives will be independent of tax component and no
adjustments in the output tax would be required to be made.”.

Amendment of Section 10.-In the principal Act, in section 10,-

(i) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely:-

“(1) Subject to sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 8, where any purchaser
has been issued with a credit note or debit note in terms of section 51 of
this Act or if he returns or rejects goods purchased, as a consequence of
which the tax credit claimed by him in any tax period in respect of which
the purchase of goods relates, becomes short or excess, he shall
compensate such short or excess by adjusting the amount of the tax credit
allowed to him in respect of the tax period in which the credit note or
debit note has been issued or goods are returned.

Explanation : While issuance of a credit note of a post sale discount
or incentive by a selling dealer, where no adjustment to output tax,
as per the provisions of sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 8 has been
made, no adjustment for reduction of input tax credit would be
required by the respective buying registered dealer.”; and

(ii) in sub-section (5), for the starting word “Where”, the words and
symbol “Subject to sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 8 and
conditions as may be prescribed, where” shall be substituted.

Amendment of section 22.- In the principal Act, in section 22, sub-

section (7) shall be omitted.

6.

Amendment of section 38.- In the principal Act, in section 38, in sub-

section (5), for the words “fifteen days”, the words “forty five days” shall be
substituted.




T Amendment of section 51.- In the principal Act, in section 51, for the
starting word “Where”, the words and symbol “Subject to sub-sections (1)
and (2) of section 8, where” shall be substituted.

8.  Amendment of section 86. - In the principal Act, in section 86 -

(i) in sub-section (5), for the words “five hundred”, the words “two
hundred” shall be substituted;

(i)  for sub-section (6)the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely:-

“(6) If a registered dealer fails to comply with the provisions of sub-
section (2) of section 22 of this Act, he shall be liable to pay, by way
of penalty, a sum equal to two hundred rupees for every day of
default subject to a maximum of twenty five thousand rupees.”;

(iii) in sub-section (9), for the words “five hundred”, the words “two
hundred” shall be substituted;

(iv)  in sub-section (16), for clause (b), the following clauses shall be
substituted, namely:-

“(b) having issued a tax invoice or retail invoice, has failed to
account it correctly in his books of account; or

(c) failed to issue a tax invoice or retail invoice as required under
the provisions of section 50 of this Act;” and

(v)  in sub-section (20), the explanation shall be omitted.
9.  Amendment of section 89.- In the principal Act, in section 89, in sub-

section (4), clause (c) shall be omitted.

.rw»\\

T



10. Amendment of the Fourth Schedule.- In the principal Act, for the
Fourth Schedule appended thereto, the following shall be substituted,
namely:- "
N The Fourth Schedule
(see section 4)
S.No. Commodity Rate of Tax
1. | Petroleum Products other than liquid petroleum gas, | Twenty paise in
piped natural gas, Compressed Natural Gas and the rupee
Kerosene such as
(1) Naptha;
(ii) Aviation Turbine Fuel;
(iif)  Spirit;
(iv)  Gasoline;
V) Furnace oil;
(vi)  Wax (except petroleum wax used for
manufacture of candles);
(vii) Mixture and combination of above
products.
2. | Liquor (Foreign and Indian Made Foreign Liquor). Twenty paise in
the rupee
3. | Country Liquor. Twenty paise in
the rupee
4. | Narcotics (Bhaang). Twenty paise in
the rupee
5. | Molasses. Twenty paise in
the rupee
6. | Rectified Spirit. Twenty paise in
the rupee
7. | Lottery Tickets. Twenty paise in
the rupee
8. | Brake Fluid. Twenty paise in
the rupee
9. | Tobacco and Gutkha, unmanufactured tobacco, bidis | Twenty paise in
and tobacco used in manufacture of bidis and hooka the rupee
tobacco
10. | Aerated Drinks. Twenty paise in
the rupee
11. | Watches costing above rupees five thousand.

Twenty paise in
the rupee




STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Amendment in section 4 is aimed to make enabling pfovisions in
the Act for levy of VAT in respect of goods described in the Fourth
Schedule at such rates as may be notified by the Government and specified
against the description of goods enlisted therein instead of a flat rate of
20%. However, this will be subject to the condition that such rates shall be .
higher than the rate of tax applicable under clause (e) of section 4(1) in
respect of goods not specified in any of the Schedules but shall not be more

than 30%.

Amendment in section 8 is proposed to disallow the adjustments in
output tax of the selling dealer and the input tax of the purchasing dealers
on account of issuance of credit notes by the selling dealers for post sale
discounts and incentives as monitoring of such adjustments is not only a
tedious job but also have no impact on the overall tax receipts of the

Department.

Amendment of section 22 is proposed to do away with filing of
certificate of registration, while applying for cancellation of his registration
or the registration has been cancelled otherwise by the department. It will
smoothen the process of online filing of application. Consequential

amendments are also proposed in section 86 and 89.

Amendment of section 38 is proposed to increase the time limit of 15
days to 45 days for seeking security from the dealers claiming refund if

security is required during processing of refund claims.




Amendment of section 86 is proposed to reduce the amount of
penalties for delay in furnishing of information relating to change in the
nature of business or closure of business, late filing of returns, non-
furnishing of information and non-issuance of invoices. The explanation
appearing after sub-section (20) is also proposed to be omitted to avoid
duplicity.

Amendments in the principal Act are being proposed for removing

deficiencies / legal lacunae in the statute thereby making the tax
administration simpler and convenient for the dealers.

The Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

(MANISH SISODIA)
DEPUTY CHIEF MINISTER / FINANCE MINISTER

(e

)

g

\\

N
&%\
ko
J

B

-

\



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

The Delhi Value Added Tax (Second Amendment) Bill, 2015 does not

involve any additional financial implications since no outgo on new posts is

anticipated from the Consolidated Fund of the National Capital Territory of

Delhi. 4//‘:\

6/ DV \
8 5 g |1
\

?:\:L;\._,‘ (),



MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

The Delhi Value Added Tax (Second Amendment) Bill, 2015 does not

make provision for the delegation of power in favour of any functionaries

to make subordinate legislation.

oo

\2)Y )



fagas dw@Im (08) 2015

feeell Jou waftfa &
(fgdra dener)

fIg99®e 2015

(Sar & s o 83 fRee @) e gur

¥ fadIia 29 S, 2015 @t yrwenfg W
S RS



2015 &1 faga® §.- 9
fawehl Heu wattha # (G wwem) faeam,2015,
fooet! qou waftha ax s, 2004 (2005 &1 3) # ot woew @ fag
TF
faea®

39 AR TR 3 Byed ¥ A s aogril 83 faeeh @1 fum @wr gwo
frregar siftrferafia fear smean—

1. wferg s, AR @ 99— (i) 39 afdf o Reeh 9o waftha ox (e dwiem)
aferf g, 2015 &1 ST |

(i) =z @l =g oy &85 e d fawaRa g
(iii) ¥z w9 fafr @ 9ol 8 O WRER, RGN 997 d AfeRpE g Faa s

g3rd fo =9 afafrag & A= grgam=t @ fov A= fifsray fraa &) o 90

2. 9RT 4 &1 GelgA, — o AT 3 arT 4 9 Syt (1) ¥, —

() @ (M) & wH w® frafafea s uforenfia fear s, efq —

() atedl e A fafds 9 & favg o sud w9 faawor & 9+ sfefea = w -
Ted 5 Aol agElt 4 fafifde g W o & ® 39 S & @3 (3) 3 g o

TR B R W I B wRg WUy § i 99 37 X | afe 9@ s

3. ORT 8 &1 GeEA. — o ARATIA BT ORT 8 § —

(i) g=1 (1) 9 s (1) @ A R FrEfafaa s afteenfa o s, serfq -

“(m) fo=h gSiima = B B ¥ AP @ Wl 4 S B g 9N R4 @ U efse

qiT ® AW 9 BT AT gicared R 9sH #3137 Refy &t sisax, [ & gd wwma ofyn
¥ grasdl & AT gasiid 9 6 dRer ¥ 999 fear o 80, qen

(ii) SuaRT (2) 7 Wvs (@) & UvEE fr=fafeag wve wfsfas fear s, sefq

"FHeT — [P SR B A1 gied ) 3 T ofse Al wWad X ued ' qen
arseye &1 # el warare @ smavgsar € s




4. °RT 10 &1 HYEA. — o Ffrfras 3 arr 10 & —
() ST @ %o oy FrefaRen seuwr yReenfid @1 S, sl —

"(1)9mrsm°r?mm1(1)am(2)aﬁaﬁwmﬁrﬁ$maﬁwaﬁrﬁaﬁaﬁws1$31§HR
a%tﬁtméﬁemﬁmwémuﬁﬁ@ﬁéwwﬁmmmmémé
aﬁqﬁwquwﬁ@iﬁémwﬁmmmm$ﬁmmwﬁwwém?ﬁ%a
ﬁ'v{ammaﬁﬁnanﬁ’rﬁmmmmﬁ$ﬁeﬁam@mﬁeumﬁmwﬁm
Wﬁmwéﬁw&wm$%€ﬁwﬁwaﬁmﬁawwﬁmmmﬁﬁ

gfagfd &)
W@W:—aﬁamsaﬁwm(ﬂw(2)$qmm$mﬁﬁ€mq\amm

ﬁﬁzﬁammﬁwﬁémmmmemmmﬁmwmﬁ
AT DT Uolind AR ERT 3qE v Bfve d uelad &1 wardeT T fear s qer

(ii)wm(s)#mﬁﬁm"aﬁ"%wmtﬂ"waﬁmﬂmh)ﬁm(z)a%srsﬁ:raw
T faiRa o, st=f ot @or P &t wRwenfa fear som

5. ORT 22 HT GG, — 4@ JfIFE & ar1 22 § STuRT (7) @ germ o)

6. IRT 38 BT WG, — @ JAFEH & arT 38 § IUeRT (5) ¥ Tvww ¥ Tl B W W
" garee i west @ ufteenRa fear smom

7. OTT 51 BT WEEH — g JIfRFET 31 anvt 51 ¥ § anfre wwm ¢ wET U @ T W ¢ SR 8
@I SUERT (1) @7 (2) & 3efi, T~ weaY qerm Rren St whenfa R STomT ¢

8. UIRT 86 &I WYNYA,— oI AT 3 o= 86 T—

(i) SugT 5 A “Ofg E TRl @ o w79 W ey @t gfenfia fear s,

(ii) Swemr 6 @ oy frefoRaa syamT gfeenfa @t s, sfq - -
”(e)uﬁmamsﬂaﬁﬁanﬁwzzﬁwm(2)a%umamfmaﬁtrmmﬁ'

sl XEW W v WAl @ WY A sifredd Ui EWR wUT 9% g@ar 7 Py o A yee
7 @ <1 @ v B TR R @ e s e

(i) SwerRT (9) 7 g W W B W W @ | ¢ wwl B whreenfia fear s,
(iv)vwmmff'm(@)$Wwﬁﬂﬁfﬁaammﬁwﬁﬁ%mmm,auh:—
"(@)éﬂﬁmmﬁéﬂﬁmwmwaﬁmwﬁﬁ'ﬁmﬁ%ﬂﬁﬂﬁm

_g;?ﬂ
(T wWﬁwso@Wﬁﬁwﬁwﬁfﬁaéwmmﬁ

T e
TEY BaT 2 T R
o R
’\l‘\i &.1¢G ‘V\r:{
\\“2;- /



(v) SUaRT (20) ¥ SEHROT BT BT SR |
9.wagﬁﬂ¥ﬁaﬁ,—1aer@rﬁwqaﬁwsgﬁ,m(4)#w(v)ﬁs”crrmﬁnﬁm,

10. AR Il &1 Weew — Aol I B v qw affrE ¥ swe W g died
INE! B I W e @t uRtreenfia frar s —

Ly

el e
ERT 4 2W)

P, 9. TEY Y DI &%
1. fafeas deiferas w, ugus Agra w, s Jq7d AW T | SIT F 20 39

BRI & sramar S vare o —

(1) 9o ;

(ii) vfager evasT w3y« ;

(iii) ©Re .

(1V)"'?'\‘ﬁa137f

(v) B9 It

(vi) d78 (e & fofor & fay ggea deifew dww @

BISaR) ;

(vii) SWiTa Sarel & Mg @ sReE
2 ¥RTE (99T T8 9Ra & s (9e3l IRME) wIg 7 20 99
3. RG] w9q | 20 09
4. ARSI (|1T) wIT § 20 99
5. ART wIy ¥ 20 49
6. YFdiwigs wike ¢ | 20 99
7. dfed feae wUY H 20 49
8. T BS wuq H 20 99
9. qqTH, TE qeHn, AT darm, €17 9o gadl qdrd, ® AT A | w9¢ 7 20 99

YT SIS) 91 d9r |
10. YT 9 ¢ H 20 U9
11. 9" ¥R WYY ¥ SATe] AN 1 °rear wI¢ A 20 49

K[ i‘fu /E}: :"}‘ :“;

\¥
\,

)




SR AR SR FT faawor

Wﬁmaﬁqﬁxﬂa@zoqﬁmﬁaﬁﬁﬁem$maﬁﬁﬁam@ﬁ$ﬁaﬁ$
fve swifad of w agef s 7 seife awgat 3 wew F 4 @ oE @ v s
4 graur Bt wud B B Ry a4 § wete | Taft a8 39 wd W g 5 el s o
ﬁ?ﬁﬁﬁ\szaﬁa%'\ﬂfa‘aﬁam4(1)6@?(§)$afmhmmﬁav@u€ﬁmmﬁm
U¥q 30 Ufeerd | warer =€ whm

@Y Swiv we ot yieares @ Ry Rear Raxt g1 o e 3 o @ aror e
W$mamﬁmm%ﬁ$mamﬁmmﬁﬁ?aﬁqﬁfaﬂ%mmaﬁ
ﬁsﬁaﬂmﬁﬁéW%meﬁa}aﬁwﬁmﬁ,mmma?ﬁ@fawvﬁaw
FI3 YA & Srerar B |

dﬁﬁw$wmw$ﬁmm&aﬂmﬁwmﬁmﬂmmwﬁﬁﬁma%wwﬁaﬁm
qﬁﬁm$umw$mﬁhﬁaﬂﬁ$ﬁmwzzﬁﬁ¥ﬁmmmﬁl U dET @t
AT ST BI3d &Y= @) ufFar amar gl TR &RT 86 T4 89 ¥ ot WY BT ywT S|

e Res 31 9fear & hm ufefy ot @ @ Ros @1 @@ o 99 a1t

uﬁqf%rmrﬂﬁ$ﬁww¢ﬁmﬁ15%ﬁm4sﬁ'ﬁaﬂ=}€gmsaﬁﬁ¥ﬁmm
Y4 ¢ |

R B 9G04 uReda & w9y § aT vwqa a9 § 9 9 AR 5t 57 5, Res
@1 fIe e @ BIgd S YA TRG T BRAT A TG O T 5 B v v @ R F w5
Bq ORI 86 A TINYT &7 UwTT 2 | gellal (@) Vo & Iy ST aRT (20) B T WS
B WHE XA BT TEdT 2 |

IR d Sl /B T B R A B Rw ge aftifem § dweT o g @ oy
f¥et @ Ty o= yomelt &Y wxet 7 g g9 o WS |

ST ST @I ERE I vg 9% R wwga 2




s Wﬁam(ﬁmwﬁw)ﬁm,zmsﬁﬁémﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁamwﬁqﬁm

?ﬁﬁ;mmﬁaﬁaﬁa%ﬁﬁaﬁrﬁvﬁwqﬁmwmﬁmﬁél

AT,
& \

/’:‘,x"/ RN
!"»L:\\ .
(G \
(*hy)

A\ T,
N N?_;/






